

Vehicle VIN# Mileage	2012 Chevrolet Impala 2G1WGSE3C1319695 144,886	2008 Ford Crown Victoria 2FACP71VX8X162469 114,581	2010 Ford Crown Victoria 2FABP78V7AX138567 112,691	2010 Ford Crown Victoria 2FABP78V5AX138566 104,236	2013 Ford Explorer 1FM5K8AR9DGA72223 134,157	2013 Ford Explorer 1FM5K8AR0DGC20761 137,866	2013 Ford Explorer 1FM5K8ARDGA72221 150,381	2014 Ford Explorer 1FM5K8AR6EGC37727 118,238
Bay Ridge Motors 1869 Richmond Terrace Staten Island, NY 10310	\$ 411.00	No Bid	\$ 557.00	\$ 557.00	\$ 1,855.00	\$ 1,855.00	\$ 1,755.00	\$ 2,435.00
Bill Grindle 1528 Gary Moore Road Oris, ME 04605-3553	No Bid	\$ 1,027.21	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Mike Berzinis 314 Seawall Road SW Harbor, ME 04679	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,080.81	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Grace Quality Used Cars 945 Lincoln Highway Morrisville, PA 19067	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 4,900.00	No Bid
Chicago Motors 2553 W. Chicago Ave. Chicago, IL 60622	\$ 707.00	\$ 307.00	\$ 807.00	\$ 1,007.00	\$ 3,807.00	\$ 3,807.00	\$ 3,407.00	\$ 4,907.00
Chris Fox	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 4,000.00
Berzinis Motors 142 Bayview Road Penobscot, ME 04476	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3,156.39	\$ 2,861.19	No Bid
Craig Florey 3976 Broadway Kenduskeag, ME 04450	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Joe Greenier P. O. Box 100 Searsport, ME 04974	\$ 1,637.77	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Yousef Dabbagh 2438 Fen View Circle Island Lake, IL 60042	\$ 768.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2,568.00	\$ 2,468.00	\$ 1,568.00	\$ 3,468.00
Jerry Blackburn 1 Mill River Road Harrington, ME 04643	\$ 707.00	\$ 207.00	\$ 307.00	\$ 307.00	\$ 707.00	\$ 707.00	\$ 607.00	\$ 807.00
Tyler Overlock	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 4,009.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 5,010.00
Frank Cochran	No Bid	\$ 300.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	No Bid	\$ 3,500.00	\$ 3,500.00	No Bid
Derek Smith All-In Taxi	\$ 2,200.00	No Bid	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 3,000.00
Ronald Laplante 342 Birch Street Bangor, ME 04401	\$ 1,777.77	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,778.78	\$ 1,777.77
Cote's Siding 2760 Broadway Glenburn, ME 04401	\$ 500.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 800.00	\$ 2,800.00	\$ 2,800.00	\$ 2,500.00	\$ 3,000.00