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Paso Robles 
 
Made predominantly from Grenache, 
Syrah, and Mourvedre, and like a true 
Rhône wine, blended with up to six other 
grape varietals. 
 
14.8% 
 
Made in the true Cotes du Rhône style, 
like the notable wines of Southern France. 
The grapes were cold soaked 3 to 7 days, 
with extended skin contact up to 5 weeks, 
and then gently pressed. The different 
varietals were co-fermented to increase  
flavor and complexity. The wine was aged 
in a combination of 25% new American 
oak barrels, 160-gallon Demi-Muid barrels 
and 3000-gallon French oak tanks to 
greater develop the wine.  
 
 
 
Our new 2014 vintage is a full-bodied 
wine loaded with rich, ripe fruit in the mid
-pallet and a long, lingering finish. We 
have updated the label color and bottle 
shape to denote the new, bigger vintage. 
The 2014 vintage has sturdy tannins 
which should allow it to age well for three 
to five years. Like all vintages of Allure de 
Robles, it will pair beautifully with a vari-
ety of cuisine.  

 

2014 Allure de Robles 
Rhône Style Red Wine 


