

LEHIGH COUNTY TAX CLAIM SALES
TAX CLAIM BUREAU
TAX SALES NOTICE

TO ALL OWNERS* OF PROPERTY DESCRIBED IN THIS NOTICE AND ALL PERSONS HAVING LIENS, TAX JUDGMENTS OR MUNICIPAL CLAIMS AGAINST SUCH PROPERTIES:

NOTICE is hereby given by NORTHEAST REVENUE SERVICE, LLC, as agent for the Lehigh County Tax Claim Bureau, in and for the COUNTY OF LEHIGH under Sections 601-609 inclusive of the Real Estate Tax Law of 1947, as amended, that the Bureau will expose at public sale in the Lehigh County Government Center, at 10:00 A.M., on September 19, 2018 or any date to which the sale may be adjourned, readjourned or continued, for the purpose of collecting unpaid 2016 and any PRIOR REAL ESTATE TAXES, PRIOR LIENS, MUNICIPAL CLAIMS, and all costs hereto, the following described set forth. Please make reference to the Tax Parcel Number and Property Identification Number with all correspondence.

The sale of this property may, AT THE OPTION OF THE BUREAU, be stayed if the owner thereof or any lien creditor of the OWNER, before the date of the sale, enters into an agreement with the BUREAU to pay the TAXES, Claims and Costs in installments in the manner provided by said Act, and the agreement to be entered into. The Bureau is prohibited from entering into a new installment agreement to stay sale within three (3) years of any default on an agreement to stay sale. (Section 603).

These Taxes and Costs can be paid up to the time of the sale.

THERE WILL BE NO REDEMPTION PERIOD AFTER THE DATE OF THE SALE.

IT IS STRONGLY URGED that prospective purchasers have an examination made of the title to any property in which they may be interested. Every effort has been made to keep the proceedings free from error. However, in every case the TAX CLAIM BUREAU is selling the TAXABLE INTEREST and the property is offered for sale by the TAX CLAIM BUREAU without any guarantee or warranty whatever, either as to structure or lack of structure upon the land, the liens, title or any other matter or thing whatsoever. Northeast Revenue, in accordance with the statute, made diligent and reasonable efforts to provide notice to the record owner. Lien holders were not notified and all properties are being sold subject to any existing liens.

It is repeated that there is no redemption after the property is sold and all sales will be final. No adjustments will be made after the property is struck down.

THE PROPERTY MAY BE REDEEMED from the Tax Sale by paying the delinquent taxes, fees, interest penalties and costs prior to the day of the public auction. The payments must be cash, cashiers check, money order or certified check. The right to redeem the property expires on September 19, 2018.

THERE IS NO RIGHT OF REDEMPTION ON THE DAY OF OR AFTER THE PUBLIC AUCTION. If no payment has been received prior to the time of the sale, the property will be sold on September 19, 2018.

Prospective purchasers at all tax sales are required to certify as follows:

1. In accordance with Section 619a of the Real Estate Tax Sale Law, 72 P.S. § 5860.619a, a successful bidder shall be required to provide certification to the Bureau that such person is not delinquent in paying real estate taxes owed to taxing bodies within Lehigh County**, nor is such person bidding on behalf of another individual or entity who is delinquent in paying real estate taxes owed to taxing bodies within Lehigh County; and
2. In accordance with Section 619a of the Real Estate Tax Sale Law, 72 P.S. § 5860.619a, a successful bidder shall be required to provide certification to the Bureau that such person is not delinquent in paying municipal utility bills owed to municipalities within Lehigh County, nor is such person bidding on behalf of an individual or entity who is delinquent in paying municipal utility bills owed to municipalities within Lehigh County.
3. Prospective bidders must register prior to sale. **NO REGISTRATION WILL BE TAKEN THE DAY OF THE SALE.**
4. A successful bidder shall not tender a bad check to the Tax Claim Bureau when purchasing property in the sale. If this should occur that bidder shall not be permitted to bid on any properties in future sales and will be referred to the Lehigh County District Attorneys Office for prosecution under Pennsylvania

Crimes Code, 18 Pa. C.S.A §4105 which may lead to a CONVICTION OF A FELONY OF THE THIRD DEGREE.

5. Pursuant to Section 601 (d) of the Real Estate Tax Sale Law, 72 P.S. § 5860.601 (d), prospective bidders must certify that they have not had a landlord license revoked in any municipality in Lehigh County and that they are not acting as an agent for a person whose landlord license has been revoked.

Certification forms are available in the Tax Claim Bureau or on-line at www.Lehighcountytaxclaim.com. Click on Upset Sale and bidder's certification.

Prospective bidders must register prior to the sale. **NO REGISTRATION WILL BE TAKEN ON THE DAY OF THE SALE.** Registration and certification forms are available in the Tax Claim Bureau and online at www.lehighcountytaxclaim.com. All prospective bidders must present one (1) form of photo identification at the time of registration and on the date of the sale. Failure to present photo identification at the time of registration will prevent a prospective bidder from being registered to bid. Failure to present photo identification on the date of the sale will prevent the bidder from receiving his bidder number and thus barring the registered bidder from having the opportunity to bid on property. **Only the registered bidder may bid at the sale using the bidder number provided by the Bureau. Use of the bidder number by individuals other than the registered bidder is prohibited and may nullify a successful bid.**

*******A deposit of \$1,000.00 (or the bid price if lower than \$1,000.00) must be made to Northeast Revenue Service, LLC by each successful bidder immediately upon the closing of bidding for each parcel. Failure to make said deposit will result in nullification of the bid and the property will be re-auctioned to a new bidder. In the event that the \$1,000.00 deposit is made but the bidder does not return to pay the balance by 4:00 p.m. the day of the sale, the bid will be nullified, the deposit will be forfeited, the bidder will be barred from future sales, and the property will be offered the following day at the same price to the second-highest auction bidder. If the second-highest bidder declines the offer, the property will be relisted at the next regularly scheduled upset tax sale.*******

The second-highest bidder will be contacted by telephone the morning of September 20, 2018 and will be offered the parcel at the HIGHEST bid in the event the winning bidder failed to make full payment on the date of sale. The second-highest bidder may decline without any penalty whatsoever, or may accept and make payment by 4:00 p.m. on Friday, September 21, 2018.

IMPORTANT Right to surplus sale proceeds. If the property is not redeemed from public sale and you are the record owner, then you are entitled to sale proceeds which exceed taxes, interest, penalties, costs, Commonwealth Liens, Municipal Liens, Government Liens and Judgment Liens.

Interest accrues at the rate of 9% per year. ¾% each month effective February 1, of each year.

The County of Lehigh does not discriminate on the basis of race, color, national origin, sex, religion, age, disability, or familial status in employment or the provision of services.

The Lehigh County Government Center is a facility accessible to persons with disabilities. Please notify this Tax Claim Bureau if special accommodations are required. The Tax Claim Bureau can be contacted at (610) 782-3119 or by fax at (610) 841-3678, or by TDD (610) 782-3119.

IF YOU HAVE ANY QUESTIONS AS TO WHAT YOU MUST DO PLEASE CONTACT THE TAX CLAIM BUREAU AT (610) 782-3119.

Northeast Revenue Service, LLC
Agent for the Lehigh County Tax Claim Bureau
Kim Ciavarella, Manager

- * "Owner," the person in whose name the property is last registered, if registered according to law, or, if not registered according to law, the person whose name last appears as an owner of record on any deed or instrument of conveyance recorded in the county office designated for recording, and in all other cases means any person in open, peaceable and notorious possession of the property, as apparent owner or owners thereof, or the reputed owner or owners thereof, in the neighborhood of such property.

** The successful bidder is also certifying that they are not the owner of the property, as the owner has no right to purchase his own property pursuant to Section 618 of the Real Estate Tax Sale Law. A change of name or business status shall not defeat the purpose of this section. For the purpose of this section, "owner" means any individual, partner, shareholder, trust, partnership, limited partnership, corporation or any other business association or any trust, partnership, limited partnership, corporation or any other business association that has any individual as part of the business association who had any ownership interest or rights in the property.

<u>Sale #</u>	<u>Municipality</u>	<u>Parcel</u>	<u>Owner</u>	<u>Property Location</u>	<u>Upset Price</u>	<u>Result</u>
18-0368	BOROUGH OF CATASAUQUA	04-640900361314-0000001	MOSTELLER DENNIS L	419 WALNUT ST	\$ 16,275.33	NO BID
18-0383	BOROUGH OF EMMAUS	07-549319099134-0000001	ROSADO INVESTMENT GROUP LLC	S 16TH ST	\$ 28,887.52	NO BID
18-0594	BOROUGH OF SLATINGTON	18-555293955615-0000001	BEERS BRIAN K & SHERRY L	66 DOWELL ST	\$ 72,392.26	NO BID
18-0603	BOROUGH OF SLATINGTON	18-556222986785-0000001	SMITH STEPHANIE A	241 S WALNUT ST	\$ 21,567.11	NO BID
18-0264	CITY OF ALLENTOWN	02-640715534816-0000001	ANB REALTY 19 LLC	809 N JORDAN ST	\$ 24,157.04	NO BID
18-0164	CITY OF ALLENTOWN	02-640579025585-0000001	BAADER HERMAN C	2632 S 4TH ST	\$ 37,964.20	NO BID
18-0167	CITY OF ALLENTOWN	02-640605563777-0000001	BARNARD JOHN M & PATTI A	969 W WYOMING ST	\$ 9,323.50	NO BID
18-0054	CITY OF ALLENTOWN	02-549688736626-0000001	BECK SAMUEL S & ROBIN L	1146.5 W UNION ST	\$ 23,485.53	REMOVED - 2016 TAXES PAID
18-0132	CITY OF ALLENTOWN	02-549784752954-0000001	BEITLER KIM M	838 N 8TH ST	\$ 13,742.20	SALE RESCINDED DUE TO BANKRUPTCY
18-0310	CITY OF ALLENTOWN	02-640772131771-0000001	BRACERO DANIEL & SARA I LOPEZ	219 E WALNUT ST	\$ 16,102.28	REMOVED - 2014 TAXES PAID
18-0208	CITY OF ALLENTOWN	02-640686756042-0000001	C EVERETT INC	412 E SUSQUEHANNA ST	\$ 5,464.19	NO BID
18-0334	CITY OF ALLENTOWN	02-641707440816-0000001	C EVERETT INC	741 N KIOWA ST	\$ 22,835.25	NO BID
18-0022	CITY OF ALLENTOWN	02-549593969359-0000001	CURTIS BUILDING CO INC	2960 HURON ST	\$ 20,724.35	NO BID
18-0091	CITY OF ALLENTOWN	02-549770132913-0000001	DAVIS ERNEST T JR	230 N 13TH ST	\$ 5,091.20	REMOVED - ENTERED AGREEMENT
18-0194	CITY OF ALLENTOWN	02-640650076616-0000001	DAVIS ROSALIE TRUST	566 W EMAUS AVE	\$ 69,391.96	REMOVED - COURT ORDER
18-0260	CITY OF ALLENTOWN	02-640714200860-0000001	ESPINAL DAMARIS & RICHARDO A SURIEL	613 N PENN ST	\$ 6,378.66	REMOVED - COURT ORDER
18-0049	CITY OF ALLENTOWN	02-549678974294-0000001	FEDO CHERYL	39 S 13TH ST	\$ 16,682.18	NO BID
18-0276	CITY OF ALLENTOWN	02-640731981770-0000001	FENTY CHVON	27 N 3RD ST	\$ 1,415.55	SOLD \$1,415.55 / BIDDER # 101
18-0327	CITY OF ALLENTOWN	02-640794222269-0000001	GRACE BUILDING CO INC	807 E HAMILTON ST	\$ 8,831.89	NO BID
18-0230	CITY OF ALLENTOWN	02-640703590902-0000001	GRANITZ JOSEPH C JR & SANDRA LEE	636 N LAW ST	\$ 5,484.60	SOLD \$5,484.60 / BIDDER # 25
18-0188	CITY OF ALLENTOWN	02-640627748031-0000001	GREATER ALTNV VETERAN'S SOCIAL CLUB	545 CLEVELAND ST	\$ 18,471.60	SOLD \$42,000 / BIDDER # 67
18-0124	CITY OF ALLENTOWN	02-549783104865-0000001	HELLER RICHARD A	641 N 10TH ST	\$ 11,732.66	SOLD \$11,732.66 / BIDDER # 73
18-0242	CITY OF ALLENTOWN	02-640705610989-0000001	JORDAN VERNON A	826 N PENN ST	\$ 8,399.72	SOLD \$23,000 / BIDDER # 25
18-0191	CITY OF ALLENTOWN	02-640645255168-0000001	KING REALTY NY INC	402 W JUNIATA ST	\$ 46,222.15	SOLD \$100,000 / BIDDER # 91
18-0180	CITY OF ALLENTOWN	02-640616887680-0000001	LEHIGH PATIO ROOMS INC	757 S 8TH ST	\$ 26,143.63	NO BID
18-0335	CITY OF ALLENTOWN	02-641709201256-0000004	LICIAGO ANGEL & YOLANDA VARGAS	1136 E LIVINGSTON ST	\$ 7,096.05	NO BID
18-0302	CITY OF ALLENTOWN	02-640745097452-0000001	LINDSAY JOSEPH D II	731 N FRONT ST	\$ 10,766.69	NO BID
18-0250	CITY OF ALLENTOWN	02-640712207114-0000001	LOEHR JOHN ROBERT	228 N LAW ST	\$ 8,475.93	SOLD \$8,475.93 / BIDDER # 17
18-0211	CITY OF ALLENTOWN	02-640698440922-0000001	LYNCH CATHERINE J	561 SKYLINE DR	\$ 6,657.52	NO BID
18-0034	CITY OF ALLENTOWN	02-549656583097-0000001	MARTINEZ CARMEN R	232 S SAINT CLOUD ST	\$ 11,153.77	SOLD \$50,000 / BIDDER # 1
18-0008	CITY OF ALLENTOWN	02-548675583482-0000001	MITCHELL JOHN & GABRIELLE VARGAS	3003 PARKWAY BLVD	\$ 35,545.16	REMOVED - BANKRUPTCY
18-0329	CITY OF ALLENTOWN	02-640796808679-0000001	MONET JAVIER	438.5 N JEROME ST	\$ 6,236.65	NO BID
18-0030	CITY OF ALLENTOWN	02-549639917123-0000001	MORTENSEN JOHN P	228 N SAINT GEORGE ST	\$ 7,986.28	NO BID
18-0108	CITY OF ALLENTOWN	02-549780693677-0000001	MOSSER JAMES R & KATHLEEN	1018 ZIEGLERS CT	\$ 37,172.71	NO BID
18-0026	CITY OF ALLENTOWN	02-549619843667-0000001	MOSSER JAMES R & KATHLEEN A	420 N ALBRIGHT AVE REAR	\$ 33,508.27	NO BID
18-0123	CITY OF ALLENTOWN	02-549783069575-0000001	MYERS GREGORY A	945 W GREEN ST	\$ 13,396.12	NO BID
18-0075	CITY OF ALLENTOWN	02-549731078079-0000001	NELLY HOLDINGS INC	1813 W GREEN ST	\$ 34,567.62	REMOVED - 2016 TAXES PAID
18-0177	CITY OF ALLENTOWN	02-640609964795-0000001	NORMAN LISA M	732 W WALNUT ST	\$ 73,484.05	REMOVED - ENTERED AGREEMENT
18-0056	CITY OF ALLENTOWN	02-549689614005-0000001	OSWALD BRADY	1130 W MAPLE ST	\$ 21,684.79	NO BID
18-0238	CITY OF ALLENTOWN	02-640704778520-0000001	PONCE JOSE SANTOS	736 N PENN ST	\$ 27,871.31	SOLD \$82,000 / BIDDER # 91
18-0319	CITY OF ALLENTOWN	02-640783172496-0000001	REHRIG BRUCE A & JUDY L	516 E COURT ST	\$ 7,583.07	NO BID
18-0137	CITY OF ALLENTOWN	02-549791025832-0000001	REPSHER MARGARET J	938 W CHEW ST	\$ 14,874.13	SOLD \$14,874.13 / BIDDER # 87
18-0229	CITY OF ALLENTOWN	02-640703583595-0000001	RICKERT LORETTA	618 N LAW ST	\$ 11,146.64	SOLD 21,000 / BIDDER # 16
18-0218	CITY OF ALLENTOWN	02-640702046236-0000001	RIVERA JOHN PAUL	715 W GORDON ST	\$ 16,005.92	SOLD \$16,005.92 / BIDDER # ?
18-0287	CITY OF ALLENTOWN	02-640741097230-0000001	RODRIGUEZ-VELEZ VICTOR	213 W COURT ST	\$ 11,442.00	SOLD \$13,000 / BIDDER # 76
18-0246	CITY OF ALLENTOWN	02-640711644776-0000001	SANCHEZ SANDY	516 CHESTNUT ST	\$ 17,886.11	NO BID
18-0296	CITY OF ALLENTOWN	02-640743632524-0000001	TYLER KEITH & RAQUEL PHELPS	235 N RAILROAD ST	\$ 15,063.39	NO BID
18-0078	CITY OF ALLENTOWN	02-549750175602-0000001	UNIVISION CORNERSTONE ALLIANCE	429 N 16TH ST	\$ 8,943.73	SOLD \$36,000 / BIDDER # 51
18-0195	CITY OF ALLENTOWN	02-640655631577-0000001	WEIR MARK	1404 S 2ND ST	\$ 9,490.64	SOLD \$9,490.64 / BIDDER # 87
18-0236	CITY OF ALLENTOWN	02-640704552904-0000001	WILLIAMS SHIRLEY E & ROLAND T JR	734 N 5TH ST	\$ 97,278.74	NO BID
18-0159	CITY OF ALLENTOWN	02-549795346900-0000001	WILLS GEORGE V & ELEANORE M	631 W WHITEHALL ST	\$ 6,982.50	SOLD \$6,982.50 / BIDDER # 73
18-0165	CITY OF ALLENTOWN	02-640579582506-0000001	YOUNG RANDALL M & SANDRA	2554 S IVY ST REAR	\$ 8,148.50	NO BID
18-0018	CITY OF ALLENTOWN	02-549575360624-0000001	ZOPPI MICHAEL & TAMMY	2848 LEHIGH ST	\$ 9,865.21	REMOVED - 2016 TAXES PAID
18-0095	CITY OF ALLENTOWN	02-549770900821-0000001	ZOPPI VINCENT J & JUNE P	132 N 12TH ST	\$ 21,090.29	REMOVED - 2016 TAXES PAID
18-0411	HEIDELBERG TOWNSHIP	10-543924523373-0000001	GOLDEN THOMAS & TARA	6836 FLINT HILL RD	\$ 41,363.46	NO BID
18-0410	HEIDELBERG TOWNSHIP	10-543924313762-0000001	GOLDEN THOMAS & TARA GOLDEN	6854 FLINT HILL RD	\$ 18,619.68	NO BID
18-0418	HEIDELBERG TOWNSHIP	10-553107933358-0000001	LLOYD JAMES H SR & GAIL M	8696 BAKE OVEN RD	\$ 44,236.53	REMOVED - BANKRUPTCY
18-0419	HEIDELBERG TOWNSHIP	10-553107933358-0000003	LLOYD GAIL M & KEITH W LEIBY	8694 BAKE OVEN RD	\$ 11,654.02	REMOVED - BANKRUPTCY
18-0420	HEIDELBERG TOWNSHIP	10-553273316631-0000001	NOTO JOSEPH J & DIANE L	RESERVOIR RD	\$ 4,664.45	NO BID
18-0426	HEIDELBERG TOWNSHIP	10-554033677044-0000002	PODORSKY MICHAEL & LAURA	6620 PHILLIPS RD	\$ 4,036.83	NO BID
18-0423	HEIDELBERG TOWNSHIP	10-554004006797-0000029	ROMIG TONY & PATRICIA GROSS	5755 PFEIFFER CIR	\$ 6,159.77	NO BID
18-0413	HEIDELBERG TOWNSHIP	10-545936974834-0000001	SCHADT JOSEPH RUTHERFORD	PA ROUTE 309	\$ 7,447.40	SOLD \$7,447.40 / BIDDER # 73
18-0422	HEIDELBERG TOWNSHIP	10-554004006797-0000020	SCHETTIG EDWARD L JR	5749 PFEIFFER CIR	\$ 10,863.84	NO BID
18-0438	LOWER MACUNGIE TOWNSHIP	12-546325804847-0000001	KLINE GLEN T JR & ALTAGRACIA	8800 LONGSWAMP RD	\$ 17,258.35	NO BID
18-0459	LOWER MACUNGIE TOWNSHIP	12-547587127834-0000001	MENZIES GARY D	4972 MEDICAL CENTER CIR	\$ 107,932.26	NO BID
18-0482	LOWER MILFORD TOWNSHIP	13-640277186379-0000001	DEKRANE DENNIS R	BELL GATE RD	\$ 7,362.58	SOLD \$21,000 / BIDDER # 6
18-0484	LOWER MILFORD TOWNSHIP	13-640384835834-0000001	DEKRANE DENNIS R	DEKRANE DR	\$ 8,143.59	SOLD \$26,000 / BIDDER # 6
18-0495	LYNN TOWNSHIP	14-541905445569-0000001	DUBOIS H THEODORE & JOAN L	BROBST HILL RD	\$ 1,287.49	NO BID
18-0486	LYNN TOWNSHIP	14-448972372175-0000001	HARMON JEFF S	DRESHER RD	\$ 7,648.17	REMOVED - 2016 TAXES PAID
18-0490	LYNN TOWNSHIP	14-540976657299-0000001	MILLER CARL B & B J REVOC LIV TRUST	7415 BEHLER RD	\$ 8,905.24	SOLD \$30,000 / BIDDER # 1
18-0491	LYNN TOWNSHIP	14-540985000398-0000001	MILLER CARL B & B J REVOC LIV TRUST	7991 KINGS HWY	\$ 5,208.63	NO BID
18-0489	LYNN TOWNSHIP	14-540973757104-0000001	REINHART MICHAEL	8083 ALLEMAENGEL RD	\$ 12,757.94	REMOVED - 2016 TAXES PAID
18-0526	NORTH WHITEHALL TOWNSHIP	16-546886398028-0000100	BARBIERI DEVON	4225 PANTHER CT	\$ 6,638.08	NO BID
18-0507	NORTH WHITEHALL TOWNSHIP	16-545976396018-0000001	BLAISE GREGORY & AMY L RUNIEWICZ	5300 PA ROUTE 309	\$ 8,976.61	REMOVED - 2016 TAXES PAID
18-0518	NORTH WHITEHALL TOWNSHIP	16-546884979185-0000029	LAUER JIM ESTATE	3258 2ND AVE	\$ 3,858.98	SOLD \$7,412.15 / BIDDER # 100
18-0544	NORTH WHITEHALL TOWNSHIP	16-547977760699-0000001	LEABOLD RONALD P	2430 OLD POST RD	\$ 14,369.03	NO BID
18-0521	NORTH WHITEHALL TOWNSHIP	16-546886398028-0000044	RAMSEY DUANE	4320 MOUNTAIN CT	\$ 4,111.77	SOLD \$3,364.08 / BIDDER # 56
18-0550	NORTH WHITEHALL TOWNSHIP	16-557073662806-0000001	VENTURES TRUST 2013-I-H-R	4858 MULBERRY ST	\$ 8,051.86	NO BID
18-0560	SALISBURY TOWNSHIP	17-548692726232-0000001	ALTABELLI JOHN A & JANE	FLEXER AVE	\$ 23,637.17	REMOVED - 2016 TAXES PAID
18-0573	SALISBURY TOWNSHIP	17-640589605331-0000001	BALANI HINDRAJ L	CRESTMONT ST	\$ 4,613.32	REMOVED - BANKRUPTCY
18-0563	SALISBURY TOWNSHIP	17-549600738528-0000001	BENEVENTO LAWRENCE A	2818 HAMPTON CT	\$ 28,658.30	SOLD \$160,000 / BIDDER # 51
18-0561	SALISBURY TOWNSHIP	17-549497734645-0000001	FOLEY ALLEN F	HICKORY LN	\$ 4,385.26	NO BID
18-0574	SALISBURY TOWNSHIP	17-640598647075-0000001	GIORDANO ANTHONY	SAUCON AVE	\$ 4,182.95	NO BID
18-0575	SALISBURY TOWNSHIP	17-641508779785-0000001	SCHEIFELE PAUL C & DORIS J	503 MOUNTAIN TOP LN	\$ 14,132.71	SOLD \$22,000 / BIDDER # 15
18-0576	SALISBURY TOWNSHIP	17-641508876878-0000001	SCHEIFELE PAUL C & DORIS J	505 MOUNTAIN TOP LN	\$ 12,834.75	SOLD \$20,000 / BIDDER # 91
18-0591	SALISBURY TOWNSHIP	17-641687750984-0000019	TAN DANNY	1617 18 SEIDERSVILLE RD	\$ 2,756.61	NO BID
18-0617	SOUTH WHITEHALL TOWNSHIP	19-548725621476-0000001	ABRAMS GAIL & MICHAEL ABRAMS	1712 SARATOGA CT	\$ 37,932.45	REMOVED - 2016 TAXES PAID
18-0614	SOUTH WHITEHALL TOWNSHIP	19-548613306848-0000001	BUTTERFLIES & RAINBOWS CHILD CARE	4060 BROADWAY	\$ 34,312.75	NO BID

18-0610	SOUTH WHITEHALL TOWNSHIP	19-547765991288-0000001	DAHER SAMER	1994 BRICKYARD RD	\$ 8,177.66	SOLD \$13,000 / BIDDER # 17
18-0613	SOUTH WHITEHALL TOWNSHIP	19-548603591056-0000001	HONALD LINDA S	4195 ANGUS PL	\$ 23,993.84	NO BID
18-0624	SOUTH WHITEHALL TOWNSHIP	19-549716513699-0000001	LAUER SCOTT G & MARIA L RAYSELY	1514 N 18TH ST	\$ 7,879.28	NO BID
18-0621	SOUTH WHITEHALL TOWNSHIP	19-548763517900-0000001	NEITH RICHARD A & PAULETTE M	1337 N BROAD ST	\$ 9,164.31	NO BID
18-0615	SOUTH WHITEHALL TOWNSHIP	19-548660709823-0000001	WHIRL CHARLES R JR & JANE M	3456 LINDBERG AVE	\$ 46,322.16	REMOVED - 2016 TAXES PAID
18-0628	UPPER MACUNGIE TOWNSHIP	20-545428524825-0000001	DIMOVITZ EUGENE & MELANIE	9524 NEWTOWN RD	\$ 12,667.30	SOLD \$21,000 / BIDDER # 15
18-0648	UPPER MACUNGIE TOWNSHIP	20-545468533800-0000332	YONS BRUCE	8778 BREINIG RUN CIR	\$ 21,304.39	REMOVED - BANKRUPTCY
18-0681	UPPER MILFORD TOWNSHIP	21-548254532284-0000001	CMSG INC	6510 CHESTNUT ST	\$ 1,400.30	NO BID
18-0701	UPPER SAUCON TOWNSHIP	22-64147777876-0000033	CENTER VALLEY LOGISTICS	4942 310 PA ROUTE 309	\$ 10,338.97	NO BID
18-0692	UPPER SAUCON TOWNSHIP	22-640447031744-0000001	GROFF CHARLES DAVID	3144 CHESTNUT HILL RD	\$ 5,910.87	NO BID
18-0779	WASHINGTON TOWNSHIP	23-556049571033-0000001	BALLAS JULIE C	6191 CREEK RD	\$ 22,343.22	SOLD \$68,000 / BIDDER # 42
18-0753	WASHINGTON TOWNSHIP	23-555235008034-0000001	EVANS ERIK	8418 REXTOWN RD	\$ 3,892.29	NO BID
18-0737	WASHINGTON TOWNSHIP	23-555122379067-0000002	MANN JEFFREY W & CAROLYN L	4209 BEST STATION RD	\$ 10,960.42	SOLD \$10,960.42 / BIDDER # 17
18-0740	WASHINGTON TOWNSHIP	23-555159484019-0000001	MARTIR MICHAEL GILBERT & V HUNSICKE	7630 CENTER ST	\$ 11,268.53	REMOVED - 2016 TAXES PAID
18-0756	WASHINGTON TOWNSHIP	23-555274156422-0000001	RATHBONE STEPHEN J	3025 SCOUT HOUSE RD	\$ 11,820.51	SOLD \$14,000 / BIDDER # 1
18-0747	WASHINGTON TOWNSHIP	23-555220023152-0000001	RAUCH RUSSELL B ESTATE	3671 MAIN ST	\$ 8,593.98	NO BID
18-0718	WASHINGTON TOWNSHIP	23-554238552784-0000001	SZACSKA KENNARD & GLORIA	9111 N LOOP RD	\$ 16,125.26	NO BID
18-0787	WEISENBERG TOWNSHIP	24-544600020642-0000002	COUGLE SHAUN	9801 DAVIES DR	\$ 3,139.91	NO BID
18-0808	WHITEHALL TOWNSHIP	25-549885628914-0000001	CAMPO ANA	570 MILLER LN	\$ 8,375.99	NO BID
18-0791	WHITEHALL TOWNSHIP	25-548886175554-0000001	HOLLER LOUIS & LAURIE	OLD COUNTRY RD	\$ 14,971.98	SOLD \$14,971.98 / BIDDER # 13
18-0801	WHITEHALL TOWNSHIP	25-549797652667-0000001	SEMA DONALDSON NUVAGA	7TH ST	\$ 5,091.57	NO BID